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2023 BNEF and Taipower Summit 
(R&D Planning Office: Chang, Hsiang-Lin )

I. BNEF (Bloomberg New Energy
Finance) is a research institution 
dedicated to developing opportunities 
for professionals in the energy field. It 
provides incisive insights from the 
world's most detailed and exclusive
proprietary database and presents
investment, economic and policy trends 
in emerging energy technology fields. 
To grasp the international information 
trends, TPC has joined as a BNEF basic 
corporate member since April 2021.
Membership benefits include 10
official accounts (access to research
reports, databases, models, tools,
various seminars, etc.), monthly 120- 
minute analyst telephone consultation 
service, and assisting TPC in planning 
and handling large-scale seminars.

II. On March 2, Ali Izadi, the Head of
Asia-Pacific research in BNEF, led 5 
members to participate in the Summit 
Meeting with Mr. Wang, the President 
of TPC, Deputy General Manager Pu,

and members of R&D Planning Office 
and Electric Economics & Social 
research office. According to the
operation status of TPC, BNEF
provides a customized professional 
analysis of electrical industry trends to 
discuss and exchange opinions with
TPC representatives. During the
meeting, BNEF shared the
transformation paths of major countries 
worldwide and analyzed their potential
economic and policy-related impacts.
In this meeting, both BNEF and TPC 
focused on the topics of "the relevant 
strategies and actions of the global
electricity industry to formulate
electricity prices", "the impact of 
Japan's restart of nuclear power on
electricity prices and case
descriptions." The relevant information 
discussed in the meeting can be used as 
a reference for TPC’s future business 
planning.
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